
Mezzo Restaurant & Lounge, 804 Erie St. E., Windsor, Ontario, 519-252-4055

First Course

Springrolls
Goat cheese, artichoke and 
roasted red pepper springrolls 
served with a pineapple chutney, 
smoked mustard aioli and 
balsamic reduction.

Calamari
Lightly floured calamari served 
with chipotle aioli.

Antipasto Misto
Marinated grilled eggplant, 
roasted sweet peppers, 
marinated mushrooms, stuffed 
olives and tomatoes topped with 
fresh bocconcini cheese.

Second Course

Stuffed Salmon
Shrimp and crab stuffed salmon 
filet, served over mascarpone
basmati rice accompanied by a 
limoncello saffron cream.

Pollo Funghi
Pan seared chicken breast 
or veal scaloppini in a wild 
mushroom, white truffle 
cream sauce, served with daily 
accompaniments.

Manicotti
Manicotti stuffed with wild 
mushrooms, spinach, goat 
cheese and ricotta cheese in a 
sambuca blush sauce topped 
with asiago cheese.

Third Course
 

Vanilla Crème Brûlée
Caramelized vanilla custard with 

Mezzo garnish.

Gelato
Ask server for todays flavors.

Cheesecake
Ask your server for today’s 

selection.

PRESENTS

To see a full list of participating  
restaurants and menus 

visit windsoreats.com

Taxes and beverages
not included.

Kindly sponsored by:

Bon 
Appétit!

$35

AUGUST 7th - 13th 2017

***No promotional items or gift cards to be used with Eat Your City***


